
ANNEX B

Privatization and Management Office Procurement Monitoring Report as of 01/11/2023
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COMPLETED PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES

PMO-01-2022
Provision of Outsourced Personnel for CY 
2022 AD YES Competitive Bidding 10/20/2021 10/25/2021 2/11/2021 11/15/2021 11/15/2021 11/16/2021 11/24/2021 12/2/2021 12/31/2021 1/12/2022 1/12/2022 12/31/2022 N/A GoP 10,500,000.00 10,500,000.00 0.00 10,420,393.20 10,420,393.20 0.00

Ms. Rebecca Q. Tugay, 
COA

Mr. Crisanto Frianeza, 
PCCI 10/26/2021 10/26/2021 10/26/2021 10/26/2021 10/26/2021 N/A

PMO-04-2022
Provision of Security Services for Leyte Park 
Hotel for the period April to December 2022) CSD NO Competitive Bidding 2/8/2022 2/9/2022 2/21/2022 3/7/2022 3/7/2022 3/8/2022 3/15/2022 3/16/2022 3/18/2022 3/30/2022 3/30/2022 12/31/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 1,960,300.00 1,960,300.00 0.00 1,960,246.39 1,960,246.39 0.00

Ms. Myrna M. Managuelod, 
COA

Mr. Crisanto Frianeza, 
PCCI 11/02/2022 11/02/2022 11/02/2022 11/02/2022 11/02/2022 N/A

Supplemental (new project)

PMO-06-2022

Supply and Delivery of Materials for the 
Completion of the PMO Building in Koronadal 
City CSD NO Competitive Bidding 6/1/2022 6/2/2022 6/10/2022 6/27/2022 6/27/2022 6/28/2022 7/6/2022 7/8/2022 7/12/2022 7/29/2022 8/4/2022 10/10/2022 10/10/2022 Corporate Budget 1,018,000.00 1,018,000.00 0.00 1,012,115.00 1,012,115.00 0.00

Ms. Myrna M. Managuelod, 
COA

Mr. Crisanto Frianeza, 
PCCI 06/02/2022 06/02/2022 06/02/2022 06/02/2022 06/02/2022 N/A

Amendment (adjustment of 
the ABC)

PMO-22-02 Pest Control Services for PMO for CY 2022 AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/7/2022 N/A N/A 2/10/2022 2/10/2022 N/A 2/16/2022 2/21/2022 3/9/2022 3/9/2022 12/31/2022 N/A GoP 100,000.00 100,000.00 0.00 87,776.40 87,776.40 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-03
Supply of Purified Drinking Water to PMO for 
CY 2022 AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/7/2022 N/A N/A 2/10/2022 2/10/2022 N/A 2/17/2022 2/21/2022 3/3/2022 3/3/2022 12/31/2022 N/A GoP 100,000.00 100,000.00 0.00 86,400.00 86,400.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-05
Repair and Maintenance Equipment for Mile 
Long Complex MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/7/2022 N/A N/A 2/10/2022 2/10/2022 N/A 2/15/2022 N/A 3/8/2022 N/A 3/11/2022 3/15/2022 Corporate Budget 32,700.00 32,700.00 0.00 28,500.00 28,500.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-06 Various ICT Software ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/16/2022 N/A N/A 2/22/2022 2/22/2022 N/A 2/22/2022 2/28/2022 3/2/2022 3/3/2022 03/15/2022 03/21/2022 GoP 835,000.00 835,000.00 0.00 832,800.33 832,800.33 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-07
Various Janitorial/Housekeeping Supplies for 
Mile Long Complex MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/18/2022 N/A N/A 2/24/2022 2/28/2022 N/A 3/2/2022 3/7/2022 3/9/2022 3/18/2022 12/31/2022 10/10/2022 Corporate Budget 621,959.50 621,959.50 0.00 326,470.00 326,470.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-08
Various Electrical and Plumbing Supplies for 
Mile Long Complex MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/18/2022 N/A N/A 2/24/2022 2/28/2022 N/A 3/2/2022 3/7/2022 3/28/2022 3/28/2022 12/31/2022 10/18/2022 Corporate Budget 86,725.40 86,725.40 0.00 85,197.00 85,197.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-09

Car Rental Services for Inspection and 
Inventory Activities in Tacloban City and 
Leyte CSD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 02/15/2022 N/A N/A 02/18/2022 02/18/2022 N/A 02/18/2022 N/A 02/18/2022 N/A 02/23/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 23,100.00 23,100.00 0.00 22,100.00 22,100.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Supplemental (new project)

PMO-22-10 Various Janitorial/Housekeeping Supplies AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/21/2022 N/A N/A 2/24/2022 2/24/2022 N/A 3/1/2022 3/3/2022 3/7/2022 3/8/2022 3/15/2022 3/15/2022 GoP 126,760.00 126,760.00 0.00 104,030.00 104,030.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-11 Various Office Supplies AD NO Shopping N/A 2/21/2022 N/A N/A 2/24/2022 2/24/2022 N/A 3/1/2022 3/3/2022 3/7/2022 3/8/2022 3/15/2022 3/15/2022 GoP 65,550.00 65,550.00 0.00 48,625.40 48,625.40 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-12
Supply of Labor and Materials for Printing of 
GAD T-Shirts AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/24/2022 N/A N/A 02/28/2022 3/3/2022 N/A 3/9/2022 N/A 3/17/2022 N/A 3/21/2022 4/1/2022 GoP 49,800.00 49,800.00 0.00 36,520.00 36,520.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-13 Air Purifier AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/24/2022 N/A N/A 3/3/2022 3/3/2022 N/A 3/9/2022 N/A 3/14/2022 N/A 3/25/2022 3/25/2022 GoP 44,999.97 44,999.97 0.00 44,940.00 44,940.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-14 Printer/Scanner AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/8/2022 N/A N/A 3/11/2022 3/11/2022 N/A 03/16/2022 N/A 3/24/2022 N/A 4/5/2022 4/5/2022 GoP 10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 8,795.00 8,795.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of CB-BOL - Brgy. Sta. Cruz, 
Antipolo City (Lot 4) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/9/2022 N/A N/A 3/16/2022 3/22/2022 N/A 3/28/2022 4/1/2022 4/5/2022 4/11/2022 12/5/2022 12/5/2022 Corporate Budget 65,860.00 65,860.00 0.00 65,000.00 65,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of CB-BOL - Cuyegkeng, Pasay 
City (Lot 5) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/9/2022 N/A N/A 3/16/2022 3/22/2022 N/A 3/28/2022 4/1/2022 4/5/2022 4/11/2022 12/5/2022 12/5/2022 Corporate Budget 24,260.00 24,260.00 0.00 24,260.00 24,260.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change in 
procurement schedule)

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of CB-BOL - Brgy. Butucan, 
Nasugbu, Batangas (Lot 6) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/9/2022 N/A N/A 3/16/2022 3/22/2022 N/A 3/28/2022 4/1/2022 4/5/2022 4/11/2022 12/5/2022 12/5/2022 Corporate Budget 81,360.00 81,360.00 0.00 80,000.00 80,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change in 
procurement schedule)

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of Elorde Sports Tourism 
Development (Lot 7) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/9/2022 N/A N/A 3/16/2022 3/22/2022 N/A 3/28/2022 4/1/2022 4/5/2022 4/11/2022 12/5/2022 12/5/2022 Corporate Budget 24,760.00 24,760.00 0.00 24,760.00 24,760.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change in 
procurement schedule)

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of National Housing Authority (Lot 
9) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/9/2022 N/A N/A 3/16/2022 3/22/2022 N/A 3/28/2022 4/1/2022 4/5/2022 4/11/2022 12/5/2022 12/5/2022 Corporate Budget 67,500.00 67,500.00 0.00 65,000.00 65,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of Selectra Electronics Corp. (Lot 
11) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/9/2022 N/A N/A 3/16/2022 3/22/2022 N/A 3/28/2022 4/1/2022 4/5/2022 4/11/2022 12/5/2022 12/5/2022 Corporate Budget 32,680.00 32,680.00 0.00 32,680.00 32,680.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-17
Repair and Maintenance of Airconditioning 
Units AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/15/2022 N/A N/A 3/18/2022 03/21/2022 N/A 3/23/2022 N/A 4/2/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 4/26/2022 GoP 45,350.00 45,350.00 0.00 40,950.00 40,950.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-18
Repair and Maintenance of Transportation 
Equipment AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/15/2022 N/A N/A 3/18/2022 03/24/2022 N/A 3/24/2022 N/A 4/7/2022 N/A 4/8/2022 4/8/2022 GoP 39,600.00 39,600.00 0.00 39,372.56 39,372.56 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-19 Various Office Supplies AD NO Shopping N/A 3/18/2022 N/A N/A 3/23/2022 3/30/2022 N/A 3/30/2022 4/11/2022 4/25/2022 4/25/2022 5/2/2022 5/2/2022 GoP 153,228.00 153,228.00 0.00 123,580.00 123,580.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-20 Various Janitorial/Housekeeping Supplies AD NO Shopping N/A 3/18/2022 N/A N/A 3/23/2022 4/20/2022 N/A 3/30/2022 N/A 4/12/2022 N/A 4/21/2022 4/21/2022 GoP 44,250.00 44,250.00 0.00 37,900.00 37,900.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-21 ICT Equipment for Servers (Lot 1) ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/29/2022 N/A N/A 4/5/2022 4/8/2022 N/A 4/8/2022 4/12/2022 4/25/2022 4/19/2022 8/17/2022 8/17/2022 GoP 520,000.00 0.00 520,000.00 493,750.00 0.00 493,750.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-21 ICT Equipment for Servers (Lot 2) ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/29/2022 N/A N/A 4/5/2022 4/8/2022 N/A 4/8/2022 4/12/2022 04/18/2022 4/19/2022 6/29/2022 6/29/2022 GoP 100,000.00 0.00 100,000.00 100,000.00 0.00 100,000.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-24
Repair and Maintenance of Airconditioning 
Units AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 4/12/2022 N/A N/A 04/19/2022 04/22/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 N/A 5/7/2022 N/A 5/7/2022 5/7/2022 GoP 16,000.00 16,000.00 0.00 15,750.00 15,750.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-27 Appraisal of Leyte Park Hotel MD I NO NP-53.5 Agency-to-Agency N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 4/6/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 N/A 10/26/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 104,000.00 104,000.00 0.00 104,000.00 104,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change in 
procurement schedule and 

adjustment of the ABC)

PMO-22-27
Appraisal of Elorde Sports Tourism 
Development MD I NO NP-53.5 Agency-to-Agency N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 4/6/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 N/A 10/26/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 6,500.00 6,500.00 0.00 6,500.00 6,500.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change in 
procurement schedule)

PMO-22-27
Appraisal of Emmanuel Community Hospital, 
Inc. MD I NO NP-53.5 Agency-to-Agency N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 4/6/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 N/A 10/26/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 10,750.00 10,750.00 0.00 10,750.00 10,750.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-27 Appraisal of NG/NPC Makati Property MD I NO NP-53.5 Agency-to-Agency N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 4/6/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 N/A 10/10/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 450,000.00 450,000.00 0.00 450,000.00 450,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Supplemental (new project)

PMO-22-27 Appraisal of Basay Mining Corporation MD II NO NP-53.5 Agency-to-Agency N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 4/6/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 N/A 12/9/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 30,000.00 30,000.00 0.00 30,000.00 30,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-27 Appraisal of Landoil Resources Corp. MD II NO NP-53.5 Agency-to-Agency N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 4/6/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 N/A 07/22/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 52,000.00 52,000.00 0.00 52,000.00 52,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Supplemental (new project)

PMO-22-27 Appraisal of Paragon Paper Industries MD II NO NP-53.5 Agency-to-Agency N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 4/6/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 N/A 07/22/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 70,500.00 70,500.00 0.00 70,500.00 70,500.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Supplemental (new project)

PMO-22-27 Appraisal of Metro Manila Commission MD II NO NP-53.5 Agency-to-Agency N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 4/6/2022 N/A 4/26/2022 N/A 07/22/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 17,750.00 17,750.00 0.00 17,750.00 17,750.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Supplemental (new project)

PMO-22-28 Backup and Recovery Software ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 5/12/2022 N/A N/A 5/19/2022 05/24/2022 N/A 5/24/2022 5/26/2022 5/31/2022 5/31/2022 6/6/2022 6/8/2022 GoP 200,000.00 200,000.00 0.00 200,000.00 200,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Amendment (change in 
procurement schedule)

PMO-22-29

Lease of 3 Units Multifunction Machines to 
PMO for the period June 1 to December 31, 
2022 AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 5/13/2022 N/A N/A 5/16/2022 5/17/2022 N/A 5/17/2022 5/19/2022 5/31/2022 5/31/2022 12/31/2022 N/A GoP 100,000.00 100,000.00 0.00 49,797.51 49,797.51 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-31
Office Supplies for PMO located in Toril, 
Davao City MD III NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 5/12/2022 N/A N/A 5/16/2022 5/16/2022 N/A 5/18/2022 N/A 6/3/2022 N/A 6/6/2022 6/6/2022 Corporate Budget 42,000.00 42,000.00 0.00 41,351.00 41,351.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Supplemental (new project)

PMO-22-30

Supply of Labor and Materials for the 
Installation of Roller Window Blinds at 6th, 
3rd, and 2nd Floor Rooms at PMO Building AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 5/13/2022 N/A N/A 5/16/2022 5/20/2022 N/A 5/23/2022 5/27/2022 6/10/2022 6/9/2022 6/25/2022 6/27/2022 GoP 55,000.00 55,000.00 0.00 42,585.28 42,585.28 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-32
Repair of Roll-Up Door at Basement of PMO 
Building AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 5/17/2022 N/A N/A 5/20/2022 N/A 5/26/2022 N/A 06/18/2022 N/A 6/18/2022 6/20/2022 GoP 20,000.00 20,000.00 0.00 18,000.00 18,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-33 Repair of Forklift at SCAIC Warehouse CSD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 5/21/2022 N/A N/A 5/24/2022 5/26/2022 N/A 5/26/2022 5/30/2022 6/8/2022 6/10/2022 06/20/2022 06/23/2022 Corporate Budget 55,000.00 55,000.00 0.00 51,887.97 51,887.97 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-35
Repair and Maintenance of Airconditioning 
Units AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/2/2022 N/A N/A 6/6/2022 6/8/2022 N/A 6/9/2022 N/A 06/18/2022 N/A 6/18/2022 6/20/2022 GoP 30,000.00 30,000.00 0.00 29,000.00 29,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-34

Forwarding Services via Sea Freight from 
SCAIC Warehouse in Valenzuela City to 
Toril, Davao City CSD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 5/27/2022 N/A N/A 6/3/2022 6/9/2022 N/A 6/9/2022 N/A 6/16/2022 N/A 6/28/2022 7/5/2022 Corporate Budget 20,900.00 20,900.00 0.00 20,069.66 20,069.66 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change of 
procurement project title 

and adjustment of the ABC)

PMO-22-36
Human Resource Management System 
(HRMS) Software ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/2/2022 N/A N/A 6/9/2022 6/15/2022 N/A 6/15/2022 6/29/2022 7/7/2022 7/7/2022 11/28/2022 12/12/2022 GoP 900,000.00 0.00 900,000.00 897,647.68 0.00 897,647.68 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change in 
procurement schedule)

PMO-22-38 Anti-Malware Software ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/10/2022 N/A N/A 6/14/2022 6/15/2022 N/A 6/15/2022 6/20/2022 6/24/2022 6/27/2022 6/30/2022 7/1/2022 GoP 960,000.00 960,000.00 0.00 950,000.00 950,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-39 Various Janitorial/Housekeeping Supplies AD NO Shopping N/A 6/9/2022 N/A N/A 6/14/2022 6/16/2022 N/A 6/16/2022 N/A 6/23/2022 N/A 6/27/2022 6/27/2022 GoP 27,650.00 27,650.00 0.00 21,750.00 21,750.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-40 Various Office Supplies AD NO Shopping N/A 6/9/2022 N/A N/A 6/14/2022 6/16/2022 N/A 6/16/2022 N/A 6/23/2022 N/A 6/28/2022 6/28/2022 GoP 37,950.00 37,950.00 0.00 25,765.00 25,765.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-41 Various Electrical Supplies AD NO Shopping N/A 6/9/2022 N/A N/A 6/15/2022 6/16/2022 N/A 6/17/2022 6/22/2022 6/23/2022 06/28/2022 7/12/2022 7/12/2022 GoP 87,920.00 87,920.00 0.00 73,939.20 73,939.20 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-42 Toner/Ink AD NO Shopping N/A 6/10/2022 N/A N/A 6/15/2022 6/17/2022 N/A 6/22/2022 6/30/2022 7/5/2022 7/15/2022 7/19/2022 7/19/2022 GoP 359,000.00 359,000.00 0.00 259,000.00 259,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-44 Air Purifier AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 06/23/2022 N/A N/A 06/28/2022 7/5/2022 N/A 7/13/2022 7/22/2022 7/27/2022 7/29/2022 10/20/2022 10/20/2022 GoP 89,994.00 89,994.00 0.00 51,000.00 51,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-45
Repair and Maintenance of Transportation 
Equipment AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 06/23/2022 N/A N/A 06/27/2022 06/27/2022 N/A 06/28/2022 N/A 7/4/2022 N/A 7/5/2022 7/5/2022 GoP 22,000.00 22,000.00 0.00 21,418.83 21,418.83 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-46 Lot Plotting Software (Sam's Plotter) DSSD NO Direct Contracting N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 06/29/2022 N/A 06/30/2022 7/15/2022 7/19/2022 7/27/2022 8/3/2022 8/3/2022 GoP 150,000.00 150,000.00 0.00 128,866.00 128,866.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-47

Appraisal of Merchants Investment 
Corporation (Canlubang Golf and Country 
Club) (Lot 1) MD II NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 11/14/2022 N/A Corporate Budget 50,000.00 50,000.00 0.00 50,000.00 50,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-50
Repairs and Maintenance of Airconditioning 
Units AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 8/1/2022 N/A N/A 8/8/2022 8/8/2022 N/A 8/9/2022 N/A 9/12/2022 N/A 10/13/2022 10/19/2022 GoP 23,000.00 23,000.00 0.00 22,650.00 22,650.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-51
PMO Flag with tassels, PMO Flag without 
tassels and  Philipphine Flag AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 8/2/2022 N/A N/A 8/5/2022 8/15/2022 N/A 8/16/2022 N/A 10/12/2022 N/A 10/12/2022 10/25/2022 GoP 10,600.00 10,600.00 0.00 10,500.00 10,500.00 0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-53 Repairs and Maintenance of Overhead tanks AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 8/12/2022 N/A N/A 8/17/2022 8/19/2022 N/A 8/26/2022 N/A
04/10/2022

N/A 10/22/2022 11/7/2022 GoP 30,000.00 30,000.00 0.00 29,000.00 29,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-54 Various ICT Equipment ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 8/17/2022 NA NA 8/22/2022 8/23/2022 N/A 8/25/2022 8/26/2022 10/10/2022 10/13/2022 12/15/2022 12/15/2022 GoP 363,000.00 163,000.00 200,000.00 363,000.00 163,000.00 200,000.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-55

General  Cleaning of Cistern and Overhead 
Tanks and Corresponding Laboratory Water 
Analysis  in MLC MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 9/7/2022 NA NA 9/13/2022 9/15/2022 N/A 9/21/2022 10/10/2022 10/10/2022 10/11/2022 11/29/2022 12/6/2022 Corporate Budget 368,000.00 368,000.00 0.00 295,800.00 295,800.00 0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-56
Repairs and Maintenance of Transportation 
Equipment AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 8/23/2022 NA NA 8/30/2022 9/2/2022 N/A NA NA 12/1/2022 N/A 12/3/2022 12/5/2022 GoP 20,000.00 20,000.00 0.00 19,087.72 19,087.72 0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-58
Repairs and Maintenance of Transportation 
Equipment AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 9/23/2022 N/A N/A 9/28/2022 9/30/2022 N/A 09/30/2022 N/A 11/7/2022 N/A 11/8/2022 11/10/2022 GoP 20,000.00 20,000.00 0.00 16,654.20 16,654.20 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-59 Lex Libris Software LS NO Direct Contracting N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 9/21/2022 N/A 9/23/2022 9/30/2022 10/12/2022 10/14/2022 10/21/2022 11/7/2022 GoP 60,000.00 60,000.00 0.00 58,464.00 58,464.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-60 Supplies for the Re-piping of Water Supply 
Connection at MLC MD I

NO Shopping
N/A 9/16/2022 N/A N/A 9/19/2022 9/19/2022 N/A 9/19/2022 N/A 9/19/2022 N/A 9/20/2022 11/9/2022

Corporate Budget 6,078.60 6,078.60 0.00 2,812.00 2,812.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Code
(PAP)

Procurement
Project

Remarks                 
(Explaining changes from 

the APP)

PMO/
End-User

Is this an Early 
Procurement 

Activity?

Mode of Procurement Actual Procurement Activity Source of Funds ABC (PhP) Contract Cost (PhP) List of Invited 
Observers

Date of Receipt of Invitation



PMO-22-61 Repairs and Maintenance  De-clogging of 
individual catch basin AD

NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/06/2022 N/A N/A 10/11/2022 10/13/2022 N/A 10/13/2022 N/A 10/28/2022 N/A 11/7/2022 11/7/2022 GoP 30,000.00 30,000.00 0.00 28,000.00 28,000.00 0.00
N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-62 Repairs and Maintenance of Cistern 
Tanks/Reservoir AD

NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/6/2022 N/A N/A 10/10/2022 10/11/2022 NA 10/13/2022 10/19/2022 10/24/2022 10/28/2022 12/15/2022 12/16/2022 GoP 80,000.00 
80,000.00 0.00

70,000.00
70,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-65 Janitorial or Housekeeping Supplies AD NO Shopping N/A 10/27/2022 N/A N/A 11/03/2022 11/08/2022 N/A 11/08/2022 11/18/2022 12/6/2022 12/06/2022 12/12/2022 12/14/2022 GoP 141,400.00 141,400.00 0.00 120,000.00 120,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-66 Various Office Supplies AD NO Shopping N/A 10/27/2022 N/A N/A 11/02/2022 11/08/2022 N/A N/A N/A N/A 12/12/2022 12/14/2022 GoP 28,440.00 28,440.00 0.00 22,945.20 22,945.20 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-67 Repairs & Maintenance of Airconditioning 
Units AD

NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 11/02/2022 N/A N/A 11/04/2022 11/08/2022 N/A 11/08/2022 N/A 12/07/2022 N/A 12/12/2022 12/16/2022 GoP 6,000.00 
6,000.00 0.00

5,750.00
5,750.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-70 IEC Materials (GAD) AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 11/21/2022 N/A N/A 11/24/2022 11/29/2022 N/A 11/29/2022 N/A 12/20/2022 N/A 12/29/2022 01/04/2023 GoP 20,000.00 20,000.00 0.00 16,300.00 16,300.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-73 Desktop PCs ITD NO Shopping N/A 12/21/2022 N/A N/A 12/26/2022 12/27/2022 N/A 12/27/2022 12/28/2022 12/28/2022 12/29/2022 01/05/2023 01/05/2023 GoP 477,484.80 0.00 477,484.80 473,000.00 0.00 473,000.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Supplemental (not available 
from DBM-PS)

 - 

0N-GOING PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES

PMO-02-2022
Provision of Security Services for Various 
PMO Assets for CY 2022 (Lot A) CSD YES Competitive Bidding 10/26/2021 11/2/2021 11/10/2021 11/22/2021 11/22/2021 11/23/2021 12/1/2021 12/7/2021 12/31/2021 1/21/2022 1/21/2022 01/31/2023 Corporate Budget 16,860,565.00 16,860,565.00 0.00 16,235,236.56 16,235,236.56 0.00

Ms. Rebecca Q. Tugay, 
COA

Mr. Crisanto Frianeza, 
PCCI 02/11/2021 02/11/2021 02/11/2021 02/11/2021 02/11/2021 N/A

Amendment (adjustment of 
the ABC)

PMO-03-2022
Provision of Security Services for Various 
PMO Assets for CY 2022 (Lot B) CSD YES Competitive Bidding 10/26/2021 11/2/2021 11/10/2021 11/22/2021 11/22/2021 11/23/2021 12/1/2021 12/7/2021 12/31/2021 1/21/2022 1/21/2022 01/31/2023 Corporate Budget 11,559,185.00 11,559,185.00 0.00 11,151,045.84 11,151,045.84 0.00

Ms. Rebecca Q. Tugay, 
COA

Mr. Crisanto Frianeza, 
PCCI 02/11/2021 02/11/2021 02/11/2021 02/11/2021 02/11/2021 N/A

Amendment (adjustment of 
the ABC)

PMO-22-04
Pest Control Services for Mile Long Complex 
(1 year contract) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 2/9/2022 N/A N/A 2/14/2022 2/15/2022 N/A 2/16/2022 2/21/2022 3/7/2022 3/7/2022 3/6/2023 Corporate Budget 198,000.00 198,000.00 0.00 142,800.00 142,800.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-22
Certifying Body for ISO:9001 Recertification 
of PMO AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 3/31/2022 N/A N/A 4/7/2022 4/22/2022 N/A 4/22/2022 4/27/2022 05/31/2022 5/31/2022 05/30/2024 GoP 200,000.00 200,000.00 0.00 117,600.00 117,600.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-37
Internet Service Provider for PMO Makati (1 
year contract) ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/10/2022 N/A N/A 6/14/2022 6/15/2022 N/A 6/15/2022 6/20/2022 6/27/2022 06/28/2022 06/27/2023 GoP 600,000.00 600,000.00 0.00 599,988.48 599,988.48 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-47
Appraisal of Technology Resource 
Corporation (Lot 2) MD II NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 787,580.00 787,580.00 0.00 782,000.00 782,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-47
Appraisal of Retired Servicemen Enterprises 
(Lot 3) MD II NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 48,520.00 48,520.00 0.00 48,000.00 48,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-48 Appraisal of AAIIBP - Bongao, Tawi-Tawi MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 105,432.00 105,432.00 0.00 105,000.00 105,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Amendment (change in schedule 

of procurement)

PMO-22-48
Appraisal of AAIIBP - Brgy. Dadiangas West, 
General Santos City MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 44,180.00 44,180.00 0.00 44,100.00 44,100.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change in schedule 
of procurement)

PMO-22-48 Appraisal of Carruf Development Corporation MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 40,440.00 40,440.00 0.00 40,400.00 40,400.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-48
Appraisal of CBBOL - Batac and Badoc, 
Ilocos Norte MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 60,520.00 60,520.00 0.00 60,500.00 60,500.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-48
Appraisal of Emmanuel Community Hospital, 
Inc. MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 42,600.00 42,600.00 0.00 42,600.00 42,600.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-48
Appraisal of Fil-Eastern Woods Industries, 
Inc. MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 48,360.00 48,360.00 0.00 48,300.00 48,300.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-48 Appraisal of Peninsula Development Bank MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 86,360.00 86,360.00 0.00 86,300.00 86,300.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-48 Appraisal of Radio Philippine Network MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/29/2022 N/A N/A 7/6/2022 7/14/2022 N/A 7/14/2022 8/2/2022 9/6/2022 9/6/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 417,120.00 417,120.00 0.00 417,100.00 417,100.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-49 Pest control services for SCAIC CSD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 7/29/2022 N/A N/A 8/5/2022 8/5/2022 N/A 8/17/2022 8/25/2022 9/26/2022 10/20/2022 10/19/2023 Corporate Budget 95,000.00 95,000.00 0.00 71,250.00 71,250.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-52
Pest control and Termite Abatement Program 
for Toril  Property CSD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 8/3/2022 N/A N/A 8/10/2022 8/10/2022 N/A 8/17/2022 8/25/2022 9/12/2022 10/11/2022 10/10/2023 Corporate Budget 170,000.00 170,000.00 0.00 130,400.00 130,400.00 0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-57
Supplies Inventory Monitoring (SIMS) 
Software AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/6/2022 NA NA 10/13/2022 10/17/2022 NA 10/17/2022 10/19/2022 11/2/2022 11/2/2022 01/31/2023 GoP 900,000.00 0.00 900,000.00 897,498.90 897,498.90 0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-63 Result of Laboratory Analysis of waste water 
discharge of PMO Building AD

NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/06/2022 N/A N/A 10/13/2022 10/13/2022 N/A 10/13/2022 N/A 10/27/2022 N/A 11/11/2022 GoP 7,500.00 
7,500.00 0.00

6,927.20
6,927.20 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-64 Appraisal of AAIIBP-Davao City (Lot 1) MD1 NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/25/2022 N/A N/A 11/02/2022 11/08/202 N/A 10/08/2022 11/18/2022 12/05/2022 12/19/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 120,920.00 120,920.00 0.00 80,000.00 80,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-64 Appraisal of Davao Timber Corp. (Lot 2) MD1 NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/25/2022 N/A N/A 11/02/2022 11/08/202 N/A 10/08/2022 11/18/2022 12/05/2022 12/19/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 64,520.00 64,520.00 0.00 50,000.00 50,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-64 Appraisal of Far East Starch (Lot 3) MD1 NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/25/2022 N/A N/A 11/02/2022 11/08/202 N/A 10/08/2022 11/18/2022 12/05/2022 12/19/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 57,020.00 57,020.00 0.00 35,000.00 35,000.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-64 Appraisal of Peninsula Development Bank 
(Lot 4) MD1

NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/25/2022 N/A N/A 11/02/2022 11/08/202 N/A 10/08/2022 11/18/2022 12/05/2022 12/19/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 48,060.00 48,060.00
0.00

30,000.00 30,000.00
0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-64 Appraisal of Philippine Seeds,Inc. (Lot 5) MD1
NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/25/2022 N/A N/A 11/02/2022 11/08/202 N/A 10/08/2022 11/18/2022 12/05/2022 12/19/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 57,020.00 57,020.00

0.00
35,000.00 35,000.00

0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-64 Appraisal of Pioneer Glass Manufacturing 
Corporation (Lot 6) MD1

NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/25/2022 N/A N/A 11/02/2022 11/08/202 N/A 10/08/2022 11/18/2022 12/15/2022 12/19/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 65,020.00 65,020.00
0.00

50,000.00 50,000.00
0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-64 Appraisal of Wright Patterson Manufacturing 
Corporation (Lot 7) MD1

NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 10/25/2022 N/A N/A 11/02/2022 11/08/202 N/A 10/08/2022 11/18/2022 12/15/2022 12/19/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget 71,020.00 71,020.00
0.00

57,000.00 57,000.00
0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-68 Supply for Labor and Materials for GAD AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 11/07/2022 N/A N/A 11/10/2022 11/18/2022 N/A 11/18/2022 N/A 12/21/2022 N/A Ongoing GoP 48,300.00 48,300.00 0.00 35,420.00 35,420.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PMO-22-69
Supply and Delivery of Materials for the 
Temporary Fencing of PMO Property (Alien 
NAFCO) in Toril, Davao City

CSD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement
N/A 11/22/2022 N/A N/A 12/02/2022 12/09/2022 N/A 12/09/2022 12/14/2022 12/22/2022 12/22/2022 Ongoing Corporate Budget

151,000.00 151,000.00 0.00 138,665.30 138,665.30 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Amendment (adjustment of 
the ABC)

PMO-22-71 SSL Certificate for Website ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 12/09/2022 N/A N/A 12/14/2022 12/14/2022 N/A 12/15/2022 N/A 12/27/2022 N/A Ongoing GoP 50,000.00 50,000.00 0.00 49,996.56 49,996.56 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
PMO-22-72 Azure Services ITD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 12/10/2022 N/A N/A 12/14/2022 12/15/2022 N/A 12/15/2022 12/20/2022 12/22/2022 12/22/2022 Ongoing GoP 500,000.00 500,000.00 0.00 498,050.39 498,050.39 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

 - 

FAILED PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES

PMO-22-01
Lease of 3 Units Multifunction Machines to 
PMO for CY 2022 AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 07/02/2022 N/A N/A 10/02/2022 omply with the mi N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A GoP 300,000.00 300,000.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

All bids received were non-compliant 
with the minimum requirements of the 
EU. Reprocured under PMO-22-23

PMO-22-16 Seven (7) Units of Smartphones CSD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 15/03/2022 N/A N/A No bid received N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Corporate Budget 104,993.00 104,993.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

All bids received were non-compliant 
with the minimum requirements of the 
EU. Put on hold pending issuance of 

DICT clearance for additional funding.

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of AAIIBP - Bongao, Tawi-Tawi (Lot
1) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 09/03/2022 N/A N/A No bid received N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Corporate Budget 105,432.00 105,432.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change in schedule of
procurement). No bid received. 

Reprocured and awarded under PMO-
22-48

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of AAIIBP - Brgy. Dadiangas West, 
General Santos City (Lot 2) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 09/03/2022 N/A N/A No bid received N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Corporate Budget 44,180.00 44,180.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Amendment (change in schedule of
procurement). No bid received. 

Reprocured and awarded under PMO-
22-48

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of Carruf Development Corporation
(Lot 3) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 09/03/2022 N/A N/A No bid received N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Corporate Budget 40,440.00 40,440.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

No bid received. Reprocured and 
awarded under PMO-22-48

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of Emmanuel Community Hospital, 
Inc. (Lot 8) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 09/03/2022 N/A N/A No bid received N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Corporate Budget 42,600.00 42,600.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

No bid received. Reprocured and 
awarded under PMO-22-48

PMO-22-15
Appraisal of Peninsula Development Bank 
(Lot 10) MD I NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 09/03/2022 N/A N/A No bid received N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Corporate Budget 86,360.00 86,360.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

No bid received. Reprocured and 
awarded under PMO-22-48

PMO-22-23
Lease of 3 Units Multifunction Machines to 
PMO for the period May 1 to December 2022 AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 05/04/2022 N/A N/A No bid received N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A GoP 300,000.00 300,000.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

No bid received. Reprocured under 
PMO-22-25

PMO-22-25
Lease of 3 Units Multifunction Machines to 
PMO for the period May 1 to December 2022 AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 28/04/2022 N/A N/A nsufficient information on TOR as ba N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A GoP 100,000.00 100,000.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Defective TOR. Reprocured and 
awarded under PMO-22-29

PMO-22-26 Air Purifier AD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 11/05/2022 N/A N/A 05/162022 t information on P N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A GoP 89,994.00 89,994.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Defective RFQ. Reprocured and 

awarded under PMO-22-44

PMO-22-43
Pest Control Services for PMO Building in 
Toril, Davao City CSD NO NP-53.9 - Small Value Procurement N/A 6/20/2022 N/A N/A 6/27/2022 ent specified in T N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Corporate Budget 170,000.00 170,000.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Defective TOR. Reprocured and 
awarded under PMO-22-52

PMO-05-2022

Supply and Delivery of Materials for the 
Completion of the PMO Building in Koronadal 
City CSD NO Competitive Bidding N/A 4/1/2022 4/11/2022 N/A No bid received N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Corporate Budget 977,801.23 977,801.23 0.00  - 0.00 0.00

Ms. Myrna M. Managuelod, 
COA

Mr. Crisanto Frianeza, 
PCCI 03/31/2022 03/31/2022 03/31/2022 03/31/2022 03/31/2022 N/A

No bid received. ABC adjusted, 
reprocured and awarded under 

PMO-06-2022

PMO-07-2022

Security Services for PMO Property in Port 
Area, City of Manila (September to 
December 2022) CSD NO Competitive Bidding 7/19/2022 7/21/2022 7/29/2022 8/10/2022 No bid received N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Corporate Budget 1,328,100.00 1,328,100.00 0.00  - 0.00 0.00

Ms. Myrna M. 
Managuelod, COA

Mr. Crisanto Frianeza, 
PCCI 07/21/2022 07/21/2022 07/21/2022 07/21/2022 07/21/2022 N/A

No bid received. Procurement project 
cancelled by EU.
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NICA GRACE C. TAGABI MARY NOREEN A. ANTONIO MARIA LIRIO A. ZABALA MELINDA B. CORTEZ ATTY. MAAN VANESSA L. DOCTOR
Focal BAC Sec for AD and ITD BAC Secretariat Head BAC Chairperson BAC Vice Chairperson Chief Privatization Officer and

Head of the Procuring Entity

SHARA MEI V. TAJAN RITOREY T. DIARON CESAR LUIS M. PARGAS MARTHA JENNY S.T. TONG
Focal BAC Sec for CSD and DSSD TWG Head BAC Member BAC Member

MARGARITA F. TACTO
Focal BAC Sec for Marketing

   Total Alloted Budget of Failed Procurement Activities 4,667,701.46 

   Total Alloted Budget of Procurement Activities 22,422,660.27 
   Total Contract Price of Procurement Actitvites Conducted 21,475,452.53 

   Total Savings (Total Alloted Budget - Total Contract Price) 947,207.74 

   Total Alloted Budget of On-going Procurement Activities 33,504,242.00 
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